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30 Facing the Mountain 

Counsellors can be on a sort of pilgrimage together with their clients who 
are suffering, either in their body or through witnessing the destruction of 
precious Earth. Joan:ne Macy (1991) has written about the spiritual pain of 
witnessing the demolition of our living planet and how the expression of this 
grief is a crucial part of action taking. Counselling doesn't have to be about 
a goal, an objective, motivation, or evidence-based, outcome-measured en­
gagement. It can be a form of accompaniment, of witnessing, of revolutionary 
love and care for another human being. Counselling can help clients find their 
way, through difficult and unknown terrain with the understanding that we 
become who we are along the way. One way to stay on the path is to refuse to 
adopt the identity of a sick person. 

As a therapist, I have worked with many people, often women, who have 
suffered from illness involving physical and emotional pain. Body pain and 
the accompanying feelings can sometimes manifest in ways that are non-de­
tectable by others outside of that body. As such, invisible disabilities receive 
little empathy, particularly in societies where individual strength, a stiff upper 
lip and the denial of personal suffering are valued. Reports of suffering are 
sometimes viewed unsympathetically, as if they are creations. Almost every­
one knows the word hypochondriac or hysterical! Sometimes, clients must 
work hard to forge their own path, of dignity, care and resistance to the off­
track view of others. 

Stigma .... What Is Wrong With You? 

Ervine Goffman (1963) wrote about spoiled identities and the (small p polit­
ical) resistance of patients in asylums and institutions. He notes that humans 
try to preserve their dignity in the face of every slight, command, and act of 
humiliation. One way that persons living with illness, adversity and various 
forms of violence experience social support, or its absence is through the in­
teraction known as the "social response''. 

Illness and disability, particularly non-visible conditions such as those of 
the auto-immune system, are made even more uncomfortable when the per­
son has to deal with the negativ� social responses of others. The notion that pos­
itive social responses are central to well-being and recovery, after disclosure of 
violence or adversity, has been elaborated in the social science literature over 
the past four decades (Andrews & Brewin, 1990; Andrews, Brewin & Rose 
2003; Fromuth,1986; Goffman, 1963). 

One example, relates to the diagnosis of PTSD. In cases of violence or 
life-threatening diagnoses, people are often referred to as being traumatized 
(Carr, 2008). Originally used in the context of head injuries or car accidents, 
this terminology has now entered counselling through the door of neurology. 
As a construct, or metaphor, trauma is worthy of closer analysis for a number 
of reasons, one being that it does not consider the quality of the social re­
sponses received by the person, a highly influential factor. Again, when people 










